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Re: Freedom of Information Request 
 
Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding children 
and young people within NHS Southport and Formby CCG. 
 
Request/Response: 
 

1. Learning Disability Annual Health Checks for Young People 14-25 years. 

Could you please provide the information below in two categories please  

a) young people upto 18  

b) young people 19-25 

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information by age group. 
 

2. CAMHS Children and Young People   

Could you please provide the information below in two categories please : 
 

a) young people up to 18  

 

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information you may wish to 

refer your query to –  

Alder Hey Children’s NHS Foundation Trust info.gov@alderhey.nhs.uk  

 

b) young people 19-25 

 

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information you may wish to 

refer your query to –  

Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk  

 
  
 
 

3. Assessment for Autism Waiting time  
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Could you please provide the information below in two categories please  
 

a) young people up to 18  

 

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information you may wish to 

refer your query to –  

Alder Hey Children’s NHS Foundation Trust info.gov@alderhey.nhs.uk  

 

b) young people 19-25 

 

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information you may wish to 

refer your query to –  

Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk  

 
4. Wheelchair services for children <18 and 18-25?? 

Could you please provide the information below in two categories please  
 

a) young people upto 18  

b) young people 19-25 

 

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information you may wish to 

refer your query to –  

Lancashire and South Cumbria NHS Foundation Trust FOIRequests@lscft.nhs.uk  

 

Please note this information is also published online and can be found here – 

https://www.england.nhs.uk/statistics/statistical-work-areas/national-

wheelchair/publication-files/ 
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