
NHS Southport & Formby CCG 

5 Curzon Road 
Southport 
PR8 6PL 

Tel : 0151 317 8456 

Email: southportandformby.ccg@nhs.net 

Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding diabetes 
education within NHS Southport and Formby CCG. 

Request/Response: 

1. What type of diabetes structured education course(s) did you provide to people living

with pre-diabetes between April 2018 and March 2019?

NHS DPP Healthier - You face to face structured education programme.

2. What type of diabetes structured education course(s) did you provide to Type 1

diabetics between April 2018 and March 2019?

NICE Compliant - face to face structured education

3. What type of diabetes structured education course(s) did you provide to Type 2

diabetics between April 2018 and March 2019?

NICE Compliant, externally validated Face to Face structured education

4. How many diabetes structured education courses were offered to people living with pre-

diabetes between April 2018 and March 2019?

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this data.  You may wish to contact
NHS England

england.contactus@nhs.net

5. How many diabetes structured education courses were offered to Type 1 diabetics

between April 2018 and March 2019?

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this data.
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You may wish to contact the providers:- 

For Adults - Southport & Ormskirk Hospital NHS Trust 
soh-tr.foi@nhs.net  

For Children - Alder Hey Children’s NHS Foundation Trust 
Info.gov@alderhey.nhs.uk  

6. How many diabetes structured education courses were offered to Type 2 diabetics

between April 2018 and March 2019?

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this data.

You may wish to contact the provider:-

Lancashire Care NHS Foundation Trust 
Freedom.OfInformationRequests@lancashirecare.nhs.uk 

7. How many people living with pre-diabetes completed your courses between April 2018

and March 2019?

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this data.  You may wish to contact
NHS England

england.contactus@nhs.net

8. How many people with Type 1 diabetics completed your courses between April 2018

and March 2019?

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this data.

You may wish to contact the providers:-

For Adults - Southport & Ormskirk Hospital NHS Trust
soh-tr.foi@nhs.net

For Children - Alder Hey Children’s NHS Foundation Trust
Info.gov@alderhey.nhs.uk

9. How many people with Type 2 diabetics completed your courses between April 2018

and March 2019?

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this data.

You may wish to contact the provider:-

Lancashire Care NHS Foundation Trust
Freedom.OfInformationRequests@lancashirecare.nhs.uk
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10. Were any of these courses offered to family or friends?

Yes the Type 2 structured education courses.

11. Were any of these courses language variant options?

Yes the NHS Healthier You courses.

12. Who delivered these courses?

NHS DPP Healthier You-Wave 1
Living Well Taking
Control and Wave 3 INGEUS.

Type 1

Children  - Alder Hey Children’s NHS Foundation Trust
Adults - Southport & Ormskirk Hospital NHS Trust

Type 2

Lancashire Care NHS Foundation Trust
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