



Our Ref: 57892

28 June 2019

southportandformbyccg.foi@nhs.net

NHS Southport & Formby CCG
5 Curzon Road
Southport
PR8 6PL

Tel : 0151 317 8456

Email: southportandformby.ccg@nhs.net

Re: Freedom of Information Request

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding mental health section 117 services within NHS Southport and Formby CCG.

Request/[Response](#):

1. The total number of clients discharged from mental health services under a S117 still receiving ongoing after care. Please provide this as three numbers CCG funded, LA funded or Joint funded and by year ,2017,2018

2017-18	2018-19
21 Joint Funded 2 Fully Funded (CCG)	25 Joint Funded 6 Fully Funded (CCG)

2. Please provide the name of any care system (software) used in the planning of a clients discharge from mental health services.

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to refer your query to - Mersey Care NHS Trust freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

3. Please provide the name of any care management system (software) used to manage S117 clients in the community

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to refer your query to - Mersey Care NHS Trust freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

4. Please provide details on when the software contract for discharge or care management of S117 patients terminates.

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to refer your query to - Mersey Care NHS Trust freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

5. Please provide details on the number of people employed in supporting client / patients who are in the community under a s117 aftercare service.

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to refer your query to - Mersey Care NHS Trust freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

6. Please provide a organisation structure diagram to indicate where S117 services fit within your organisation.

The organisation structure diagram is currently under review (section 117 services fit within the Director of Strategies and Outcomes directorate).

7. Please provide the job title of the person responsible for S117 services and the name of the Directorate that is responsible

Geraldine O'Carroll – Senior Manager Commissioning & Redesign

8. Please provide the name of the post that works with LA to determine the appropriate funding split.

Adult Mental Health Complex Case Co-ordinator

9. Please provide details on the expenditure on S117 in 2016, 2017, 2018

2016-17	2017-18	2018-19
£127,707	£357,979	£582,041

10. Please provide the name and contact details for the head of service and the administrators name and contact details.

Paul Whittle, Mental Health Lead. Midlands and Lancashire Commissioning Support Unit.
Tel: 01772 214046 - Mob 07557205125
Email: paul.whittle3@nhs.net

Susan Rushton, Administrator Adult MH Complex Care, Midlands and Lancashire
Commissioning Support Unit.
Tel: 0151 296 7323 option 4
Email: susan.rushton1@nhs.net