
NHS Southport & Formby CCG 

5 Curzon Road 
Southport 
PR8 6PL 

Tel : 0151 317 8456 

Email: southportandformby.ccg@nhs.net 

Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding 
Investigations into the deaths of patients with a learning disability within NHS Southport and 
Formby CCG. 

Request/Response: 

1. the number of deaths of patients with a learning disability that occurred in the last three

years (by years defined as 1/4/16 - 31/3/17, 1/4/17 - 31/3/18, 1/4/18 to present).

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information; you may wish to refer your 

query to:- 

Southport & Ormskirk Hospital NHS Trust 

soh-tr.foi@nhs.net  

Mersey Care NHS Trust 

freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk 

Lancashire Care NHS Foundation Trust 

Freedom.OfInformationRequests@lancashirecare.nhs.uk 

2. the number of independent investigations into the deaths of patients with a learning

disability that you have commissioned in the last three years (defined as above)

As part of the national Learning Disability Mortality Review programme, the CCG have 

assigned 19 cases to a LeDeR reviewer  

1/4/16 - 31/3/17 - 2 

1/4/17 - 31/3/18 - 12 

1/4/18 to present - 5 

Our Ref: 57182 

15 April 2019 

southportandformbyccg.foi@nhs.net 
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3. the number of deaths of patients with a learning disability that have resulted in an inquest in

the last three years (defined as above)

4. of those inquests the number that were an Article 2 inquest

For Questions 3-4 – NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information; you
may wish to refer your query to:-

Southport & Ormskirk Hospital NHS Trust
soh-tr.foi@nhs.net

Mersey Care NHS Trust
freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

Lancashire Care NHS Foundation Trust
Freedom.OfInformationRequests@lancashirecare.nhs.uk
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