NHS

Southport and Formby

Clinical Commissioning Group

our Ref: FOI ID 41528 NHS Southport & Formby CCG
’ 5 Curzon Road
Southport

16 October 2017 PR8 6PL
southportandformbyccg.foi@nhs.net Tel : 01704 387028

Email: southportandformby.ccg@nhs.net

Re: Freedom of Information Request

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding CHC
funding within Southport and Formby CCG.

Request/Response:

1. How many people applied to your CCG for continuing healthcare funding between 2013 —
present

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold the information for 2013/14.

2014/15 — 256
2015/16 — 162
2016/17 — 124

2. Of these, how many are successful in being granted the funding between 2013 — present
NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold the information for 2013/14.
2014/15 - 128

2015/16 — 67
2016/17 — 64

3. Of these, how many were unsuccessful between 2013 — present
NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold the information for 2013/14.
2014/15 - 128

2015/16 — 95
2016/17 — 60
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4. Of the cases that were unsuccessful, how many asked for the CCG to review their
application for funding between 2013 — present? How many of these reviews found in
favour of the applicant?

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold the information for 2013/14.

Cases Eligible | Not eligible Part eligible

received
2014/2015 2 1 1 0
2015/2016 1 1 0 0
2016/2017 4 (1 case 2 1 0

still on-

going)

5. How many cases were transferred to an independent review panel between 2013- present?
0
How many of the independent reviews found in favour of the applicant

Not applicable
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