
Chair: Dr Rob Caudwell 
Chief Officer: Fiona Taylor 

NHS Southport & Formby CCG 

5 Curzon Road 
Southport 
PR8 6PL 

Tel : 01704 387028 
Email: southportandformby.ccg@nhs.net 

Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding heart 
failure with the treatment of Furosemide within NHS Southport and Formby CCG. 

Request/Response: 

1) Number of inpatients with heart failure in the last 5 years, with heart failure being any part of the
diagnosis 

Commissioner 2013/14 2014/15 2015/16 2016/17 

Southport & Formby 
CCG 

961 1007 1110 1086 

2) Number of inpatients with heart failure in the last 5 years, with heart failure being the primary
diagnosis 

Commissioner 2013/14 2014/15 2015/16 2016/17 

Southport & Formby 
CCG 

141 166 173 200 

3) Number of inpatients, regardless of condition, were treated with Furosemide (tablets or
intravenous injection) in the last 5 years  

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information; please redirect your query to – 

NHS Southport and Ormskirk Hospital NHS Trust 
soh-tr.foi@nhs.net 

4) Number of inpatients that were treated with Furosemide in the last 5 years had heart failure as
any part of the diagnosis  

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information; please redirect your query to – 

NHS Southport and Ormskirk Hospital NHS Trust 
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southportandformbyccg.foi@nhs.net 
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soh-tr.foi@nhs.net 

5) Number of inpatients that were treated with Furosemide in the last 5 years had heart failure as
the primary diagnosis 

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information; please redirect your query to – 

NHS Southport and Ormskirk Hospital NHS Trust 
soh-tr.foi@nhs.net 
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