

Our ref: FOI ID 37173

17 May 2017

southportandformbyccq.foi@nhs.net

NHS Southport & Formby CCG 5 Curzon Road Southport PR8 6PL

Tel: 01704 387028

Email: southportandformbyccg.foi@nhs.net

Re: Freedom of Information Request

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding obesity in childhood services within NHS Southport and Formby CCG.

Request/Response:

1. What service/resources that you have in your area for children and young adults with obesity? either at Primary or at secondary care

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information as the local authority commissions the above service. You may wish to redirect your query to Sefton Council

information@sefton.gov.uk

2. Have you commissioned Tier 3 or 4 childhood obesity service in your area?

No specific Tier 3 paediatric obesity service is commissioned. Such needs will be met primarily through a multidisciplinary approach involving paediatricians, community children's dieticians, weight management practitioners and CAMHS (as appropriate).

Tier 4 services are commissioned by NHS England Specialised Commissioning Team. You may wish to redirect your query to NHS England

england.contactus@nhs.net

3. Is there any referal pathway?

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information. You may wish to redirect your query to the provider

Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust Info.gov@alderhey.nhs.uk