
Chair: Dr Rob Caudwell 
Chief Officer: Fiona Taylor 

Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding eating 
disorder services within NHS Southport and Formby CCG. 

Request/Response: 

In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I would be very grateful if you could 
please send details for: 

1) All in-patient and out-patient eating disorder services currently provided for CAMHS and
adult services in your area

NHS Southport and Formby CCG commission Alder Hey (in partnership with Liverpool
CCG) to deliver a Specialist Community Eating Disorder Service for young people up to
18. In addition our local CAMHS provider (Alder hey) does support young people with less
severe eating disorders.

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not commission adult in-patient eating disorder
services, this service is commissioned by Specialised Commissioning, NHS England.  NHS
Southport and Formby CCG commissions Mersey Care NHS Trust to commission the
service for out-patients.

2) The budget and monies promised to deliver the CAMHS access and waiting time standards
on Eating Disorders

2014/2015 2015/2016 2016/2017 2017/2018 

No funding £72,000 £72,000 Not yet available 

3) The budget and monies received to deliver the CAMHS access and waiting time standards
on Eating Disorders

2014/2015 2015/2016 2016/2017 2017/2018 

No funding £72,000 £72,000 Not yet available 
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4) Your total budget and expenditure for all CAMHS eating disorder services (please include
any additional monies received to deliver access and waiting time standards, as specified in
Question 3)

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information.  NHS Southport and
Formby CCG commissions core CAMHS services and does not disaggregate budget and
expenditure specifically for eating disorders.  You may wish to redirect your query to the
provider or NHS England

NHS England
england.contactus@nhs.net

Alder Hey Children’s NHS Foundation Trust
Info.gov@alderhey.nhs.uk

5) Your total budget and expenditure for all adult eating disorder services

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information due to the service being
commissioned as a historical block contract.

6) Your average and range of waiting times for CAMHS eating disorder services for both
severe and non-severe cases

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to redirect
your query to the Provider

Alder Hey Children’s NHS Foundation Trust
Info.gov@alderhey.nhs.uk

7) Your average and range of waiting times for adult eating disorder services for both severe
and non-severe cases

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to redirect 
your query to the Provider 

Mersey Care NHS Trust 
freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk 

We are requesting information for Question 2-7 in the financial years: 2014/15, 2015/16, 
2016/17 and 2017/18. 
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